
 

 

 

 

 

CITY OF SALISBURY 
 

CITY COUNCIL AGENDA 
 

 

October 28, 2019                                  6:00 p.m. 
Government Office Building  Room 301 

 
   Times shown for agenda items are estimates only. 

 
 

6:00 p.m.  CALL TO ORDER 
   
6:01 p.m.  WELCOME/ANNOUNCEMENTS 
   

6:02 p.m.  CITY INVOCATION – Pastor Betty Cropper of Riverside United Methodist Church 

   
6:04 p.m.  PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE TO THE FLAG OF THE UNITED STATES OF AMERICA 
 
6:05 p.m. 

 
PRESENTATIONS – Mayor Jacob R. Day 

 Municipal Government Works Month Proclamation 
   
6:07 p.m.  ADOPTION OF LEGISLATIVE AGENDA 
   
6:08 p.m.  CONSENT AGENDA – City Clerk Kimberly Nichols  
   Resolution No. 2980‐ approving the appointment of Evan Deckers to the 

Sustainability Advisory Committee for term ending September 2022 
 Resolution No. 2981‐ approving the appointment of Mark Frieden to the 

Sustainability Advisory Committee for term ending October 2022 
 Resolution No. 2982‐ approving the reappointment of David Plotts to the Parks and 

Recreation Committee for term ending November 2022 
   
6:11 p.m.  AWARD OF BIDS –  Procurement Director Jennifer Miller 
   Change Order #2 ‐ ITB 19‐120 Newton Street Community Center 

 
6:14 p.m.  PUBLIC HEARING‐ Timber Crest SBY, LLC‐Schumaker Lane Annexation ‐ presented by City 

Administrator Julia Glanz 

   Resolution No. 2974‐ proposing the annexation to the City of Salisbury of certain area 

of land contiguous to and binding upon the southerly Corporate Limit of the City of 

Salisbury to be known as “Timber Crest SBY, LLC‐Schumaker Lane Annexation”  

 Resolution No. 2975‐ approving the proposed annexation plan of land contiguous to 

and binding upon the southerly Corporate Limit of the City of Salisbury to be known 

as “Timber Crest SBY, LLC‐Schumaker Lane Annexation” 

   



6:24 p.m.  RESOLUTIONS – presented by City Administrator Julia Glanz 

 

 Resolution No. 2967‐ proposing the annexation to the City of Salisbury of a certain 
area of land contiguous to and binding upon the southerly Corporate Limit of the City 
of Salisbury to be known as “Johnson Road‐Dirk Widdowson Annexation” beginning 
for the same at a point being South from a corner of the existing Corporate Limit of 
the City of Salisbury and also being on the westerly line of and near the northwesterly 
corner of the lands of Dirk Widdowson located at 927 Johnson Road continuing 
around the perimeter of the affected property to the point of beginning 
 

 Resolution No. 2968‐ to adopt an annexation plan for a certain area of land 
contiguous to and binding upon the southerly Corporate Limit of the City of Salisbury 
to be known as “Johnson Road‐Dirk Widdowson Annexation” beginning for the same 
at a point being South from a corner of the existing Corporate Limit of the City of 
Salisbury and also being on the westerly line of and near the northwesterly corner of 
the lands of Dirk Widdowson located at 927 Johnson Road continuing around the 
perimeter of the affected property to the point of beginning 

 

6:44 p.m.  ORDINANCES – presented by City Attorney Mark Tilghman 

 

   Ordinance No. 2566‐ 1st reading ‐ approving an amendment of the FY2020 Fire 
Department Budget to transfer insurance funds received by the City to the Fire 
Department Operating Budget from the General Fund for revenue received for repairs
 to Ambulance A‐2 
 

 Ordinance No. 2567‐ 1st reading ‐ approving a Budget Amendment of the FY2020 Fire 
Department Budget to transfer funds from the City General Fund to the Fire  
Department Operating Budget to cover expenses for vehicle maintenance 
 

 Ordinance No. 2568‐ 1st reading ‐ approving an amendment of the FY 2020 General  
Fund Budget to appropriate funds needed to administer an Election in Districts One, 
Two, Three, Four and Five in the event of a resulting tie in the November 5, 2019 City 
Election 
 

 Ordinance No. 2569‐ 1st reading ‐ approving a Budget Amendment of the Grant Fund to
appropriate funds from a Community Needs Grant, from the Community Foundation of 
the Eastern Shore, Inc., awarded for the City of Salisbury Youth Civics Council 
 

 Ordinance No. 2562‐ 2nd reading‐ to amend Sections 15.04.010, 15.04.020, and 
15.04.030 of Chapter 15.04 Building Code by adopting updated standard codes in     
Section 15.04.010; amending the amendments to the International Building Code            
(2018) (IBC) in Section 15.04.020; and amending the amendments to the International 
Plumbing Code (2018) (IPC) in Section 15.04.030, and to amend Section 15.24.040 of 
Chapter 15.24 Housing Standards to adopt the updated Standard Codes 
 

 Ordinance No. 2563‐ 2nd reading‐ approving an amendment of the City’s Capital Project
Fund Budget and the FY2020 General Fund Budget to appropriate funds for community 
centers 
 



 Ordinance No. 2564‐ 2nd reading‐ approving a budget amendment of the FY2020             
General Fund Budget to accept and appropriate the funds received from the Heron 
Agility Group, Furry Friends Pet Services, and Mrs. Allison Niles in memory of her             
mother Mrs. Joan Clark, for the purchase of K‐9 bullet proof vests 
 

 Ordinance No. 2565‐ 2nd reading‐ approving an amendment of the FY20 Budget to 
appropriate funds for street resurfacing and concrete repair 

 

7:11 p.m.  PUBLIC COMMENTS 
   
7:16 p.m.  ADJOURNMENT 
   
 

Copies of the agenda items are available for review in the City Clerk’s Office, Room  
     305– City/County Government Office Building, 410‐548‐3140 or on the City’s           
website www.salisbury.md. City Council Meetings are conducted in Open Session   
  unless otherwise indicated.  All or part of the Council’s meetings can be held in          
Closed Session under the authority of the  Maryland Open Meetings Law, Annotated  
Code of Maryland General Provisions Article § 3‐305(b), by vote of the City Council. 

                                                                
                                                                        

                                                      NEXT COUNCIL MEETING – NOVEMBER 12, 2019 (Tuesday) 
 
 

 Ordinance No. 2566- 2nd reading - approving an amendment of the FY2020 Fire Department Budget to transfer insurance funds 
received by the City to the Fire Department Operating Budget from the General Fund for revenue received for repairs to 
Ambulance A-2 

 Ordinance No. 2567- 2nd reading - approving a Budget Amendment of the FY2020 Fire Department Budget to transfer funds 
from the City General Fund to the Fire Department Operating Budget to cover expenses for vehicle maintenance 

 Ordinance No. 2568- 2nd reading - approving an amendment of the FY 2020 General Fund Budget to appropriate funds needed to 
administer an Election in Districts One, Two, Three, Four and Five in the event of a resulting tie in the November 5, 2019 City 
Election 

 Ordinance No. 2569- 2nd reading - approving a Budget Amendment of the Grant Fund to appropriate funds from a Community 
Needs Grant, from the Community Foundation of the Eastern Shore, Inc., awarded for the City of Salisbury Youth Civics Council 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Posted 10/24/19 



   

 



Evan Deckers 
3792 St. Lukes Road 
Salisbury, MD 2184 
(301)697-3873 
evan.deckers94@gmail.com 
September 5, 2019 

To Whom It May Concern, 

I am writing this letter in hopes of obtaining a position on the  Sustainability Advisory Committee or Green Team.  I am 
currently working with the Nanticoke Watershed Alliance as the Education Coordinator where I come in contact with 
many Salisbury citizens who whom I am unable to work due to the nature of our grant funding. I am interested in 
going the Green Team to give back to the community in which I live and to help the city realize some of it's green 
initiatives. There are plenty of citizens who are passionate about creating a more sustainable community and I want to 
be a part of the team that is helping to make this a reality.  

I would be a good candidate of the Sustainability Advisory Committee because I am passionate about creating 
sustainable communities and I am currently involved with environmental restoration and conservation efforts through 
my occupation. I live in the greater Salisbury area and enjoy the benefits of a city that is proactive in its care of the 
environment. As an employee for a non-profit that focuses on collaboration as opposed to advocacy, I will be able to 
provide the Committee with my expertise in working  with a wide range of stakeholders that, more often than not, do 
not see eye to eye. I want help the Green Team implement green projects that are not just accepted by the 
community, but embraced. I believe that the connections I have made while living in Salisbury will help me provide a 
well-rounded perspective to the Green Team.  

Thank you for considering me for this position. Creating a healthy community starts by creating a healthy environment 
for the citizens to use and cherish. Feel free to contact me at email evan.deckers94@gmail.com, or call at 
301-697-3873. Thank you again; I look forward to hearing from you.  

 

Sincerely yours, 

Evan Deckers



Education

Work Experience

 

Internships / Volunteer Experience  

  
 

Certifications and Accomplishments 

 

  Skills

Evan Deckers 301-697-3873 | evan.deckers94@gmail.com | Salisbury, MD 

Salisbury University
 Salisbury, MD 21801 
  - Bachelor of Arts - BA, Spanish 
  - Bachelor of Arts - BA, Environmental Studies 
CEDEI - Center for Interamerican Studies
 Cuenca, Ecuador 
  - Study Abroad Semester

August 2014 - May  2018 

January 2018  

Chesapeake Bay SAV Watchers - Volunteer Monitor Trainer Certification 
AquaticWILD - Environmental Educator Certification 
National Park Service - Foundations of Interpretation Certification 
CPR Certified (current) 
Project Learning Tree - Environmental Educator Certification

2019 
2018 
2018 
2018 
2017 

Read/Write/Speak Spanish       Social Media Marketing   Data Entry 
Interpretive Educational Programs      Photoshop / inDesign   Mircosoft Office 
Guiding and Leadership Experience      Animal Care & Behavioral Training  Apple Software 
Grant Writing and Preparation       Event and Project Coordination  Budget Management 
Interdisciplinary Collaboration       Wordpress Website Creation   Database Management

Nanticoke Watershed Alliance
Vienna, MD 
 - Deliver Formal Education Programs for 1000+ seventh-graders annually 
 - Create 6-10 social media posts/month; design 3-6 brochures/year 
 - Coordinate 2-5 projects at all times, including meetings and budgeting 
Delmarva Discovery Center 
Pocomoke City, MD 
 - Interpretive animal programs for as many as 50 guests of all ages 
 - Target training and enrichment with otters, enclosure cleaning and other care 
 - Care of 10+ herpetological species housed at discovery center 
Salisbury University Horticulture
Salisbury, MD 

- Care of lawns, flowerbeds and rain gardens 
 - Responsible for, upkeep of athletic fields, recycling and waste management 
Assateague Outfitters 
Assateague National Seashore, Berlin, MD 
 - Guided and educated guests on 2 hour tour, took photos, maintained safety 
 - 50+ boat rentals per day, paddling instruction, clamming demos 

Dan’s Mountain State Park
Lonaconing, MD  
 - Received CPR and First Aid certifications, Oversaw 100+ visitors per day 
 - Daily physical/skill training, hourly chemical checks  

Western Maryland Adventures
Cumberland, MD 
 - 3 two-hour, off-road Segway tours a day: instruction and safety, tour, clean up 
 - Children’s program aid, campfire host, cleaned boats and life vests

Education Coordinator
May 2018 - Present 

 

Interpretive Educator / Animal Husbandry 
July 2017 - May 2018 

  

Student Grounds Worker
Jan 2016 - August 2017 

  

State Park Lifeguard
Summers 2013, 2014 

  

Segway Tour Guide and Rental Staff
Summer 2012

Floating Tour Guide and Kayak Rental Staff 
Summer 2015

Ward Museum of Wildfowl Art (Internship; Education Department) 
Delmarva Discovery Center (Internship; Animal Husbandry) 
AYSO Soccer Referee (reffing games and training younger volunteers) 
YMCA Camp Bright Star (summer camp for special needs children)

February  2018 - May 2018  
May 2017 - July 2017 

Fall 2015 
2010, 2011



RESOLUTION NO.  2980 1 
 2 

 BE IT RESOLVED, by the City of Salisbury, Maryland that the following 3 
individual is appointed to the Sustainability Advisory Committee, for the term ending as 4 
indicated. 5 
 6 
  Name      Term Ending 7 
  Evan Deckers     September 2022 8 
   9 
 10 
 THE ABOVE RESOLUTION was introduced and duly passed at a meeting of the 11 
Council of the City of Salisbury, Maryland held on October 28, 2019. 12 
 13 
ATTEST: 14 
 15 
 16 
_____________________________   _____________________________ 17 
Kimberly R. Nichols     John R. Heath 18 
CITY CLERK      PRESIDENT, City Council 19 
 20 
 21 
APPROVED BY ME THIS 22 
 23 
__________ day of ______, 2019. 24 
 25 
 26 
_____________________________ 27 
Jacob R. Day 28 
MAYOR, City of Salisbury 29 



   

                             MEMORANDUM 
                        
                         
 

To: Mayor Jake Day 

From: Laura Baasland, Department of Water Works Program Specialist 

Subject: Appointment to the Sustainability Advisory Committee

Date: October 24, 2019 

Mayor Day, the following person has applied for appointment to the Sustainability Advisory 
Committee for the term ending as indicated: 
 
   Name    Term Ending 
   Mark Frieden   October 2022 
 
Attached you will find information from Mark Frieden and the resolution necessary for his 
appointment. If you approve of this appointment, I will forward this information to the City 
Council so it may be placed on their agenda at the next Council meeting. Please let me know 
if you have any questions. 
 
Attachment 
 



 
 
 
 
August 27, 2019 
 
Mayor Jacob Day 
125 N. Division Street 
Salisbury, MD 21801 
 
Dear Mayor Day:  
 
Livable communities should be the right of all residents and include clean water and air, 
landscapes and a built environment that is aesthetically pleasing and functional, transportation 
and reliable and affordable energy. This belief is why I’m interested in being selected to serve on 
the City of Salisbury’s Sustainability Advisory Committee. Terri Gladus, the chair of the Green 
Team Committee, suggested I apply to serve on the team.  
 
My background and work with local jurisdictions, businesses and organizations to consult on 
sustainability issues ranging from energy efficiency to waste disposal to transportation 
marketing. Some of my experience includes:  
 

• Assisting businesses with office and production recycling and composting to reduce 
waste sent to a landfill 

• Educating consumers and businesses in Arlington County, Virginia about cost-effective 
energy efficiency actions that can be enacted at home or in an office including use of 
LED bulbs, motion sensors, thermostat settings and electric and natural lighting 

• Promoting alternative transportation to residents and businesses in Northern Virginia 
through events, collateral material and digital marketing to reduce single-occupancy-
vehicle use 

• Advocating for safe walking and cycling routes for everyone 
 
I enjoy working with teams that are diverse in expertise to find solutions to difficult 
environmental issues and have already attended the August 2019 Green Team meeting. 
Although I’ve only lived in Salisbury since May 2019, I have gotten to know the area and its 
people well. I look forward to bringing my expertise in all things “green” to the city, its 
businesses and residents.  
 
Best regards, 
 
 
Mark Frieden 
Markfrieden1@gmail.com  
 
 



MARK ANDREW FRIEDEN, MBA 
 markfrieden1@gmail.com   n 703.864.7576   n www.linkedin.com/in/mfrieden 

Page 1 of 2 
 

CORPORATE SOCIAL RESPONSIBILITY, PARTNERSHIPS, NEW BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT 
 
Professional Profile 
 
From volunteer experiences growing up through consulting on corporate social responsibility, I have a strong passion for 
responsible business, education and lifelong learning; Strategic consulting with businesses to assess and increase their 
environmental, social and governance performance to optimize their success, profitability and positive impact for their 
stakeholders; Over 10 years of experience in CSR/sustainability consulting and business development  
 
Expertise  
 
Corporate Social Responsibility • Sustainability • Strategic Consulting • Business Development • Responsible Business 
Strategy • Energy Efficiency • Alternative Transportation • Recycling • Public Speaking & Presentations • Health & Wellness  
• Project Management  • Business Writing

Experience 
 
Crossbow Strategies, Salisbury, MD        2016 – Present 
Business consultancy working with companies to develop and implement environmental, social and governance (ESG) strategies that 
measure the business’s key performance indicators (KPIs) 
 
BUSINESS CONSULTANT 
§ Advise and guide 10+ companies through third-party sustainable business certifications such as  

B Corporation Certification that evaluates its Governance, Employees, Suppliers, Community and Environment  
§ Optimize certification’s value by educating stakeholders through presentations, press releases and digital 

marketing communications 
§ Develop key performance indicators (KPIs) for 12+ businesses including community impact, employee 

engagement, transportation planning and improvements in energy efficiency, recycling and green building upgrades  
§ Write company policies for Environmental Management Systems (energy, water, waste), Purchasing, Supplier Code 

of Conduct, Employee Handbook 
§ Grow new business from tourist boards and hotels of $50K for travel media startup KindTraveler.com that benefits 

local charities through donations and volunteer opportunities 
§ Educate business groups about the importance of embedding corporate social responsibility strategies and achieving 

relevant third-party certifications through presentations and panel discussions 
 
NeoNiche Strategies, Arlington, VA        2012 – 2016 
Outreach marketing and communications company that works with governments and businesses to create positive behavior change 
DIRECTOR, PARTNERSHIPS & BUSINESS DEVELOPMENT 
 
§ Responded to local government RFPs for alternative transportation and energy efficiency behavior change 

marketing projects  
§ Developed partnerships with municipal governments to deliver transportation marketing programs aimed 

at 400 businesses, schools, universities and non-profits to encourage use of public transportation, walking, biking and 
carpooling to reduce single-occupancy vehicle traffic  

§ Planned and delivered 30 presentations on commuting options and benefits to employees and business owners 
§ Led the creation of effective collateral materials for distribution at scheduled outreach events for Arlington County’s 

energy efficiency program, Arlington Initiative to Rethink Energy (AIRE) 
 
American Society of Landscape Architects, Washington, DC                 2004 – 2011 
Professional membership association totaling 14,000 members throughout North America 
SALES MANAGER 
 
§ Generated $1.9 million in revenues for print advertising (Landscape Architecture Magazine), exhibit space, 

sponsorship and corporate memberships (105% of goal) 
§ Grew sales among existing clients by 10% through upselling and sales of additional services 
§ Built sales pipeline organically through referrals, cold calling, online research and industry trade shows  



 

MARK ANDREW FRIEDEN, MBA 
markfrieden1@gmail.com   n 703.864.7576   n www.linkedin.com/in/mfrieden 

Page 2 of 2 
 
Education 
 
MBA in Environmental Policy and Management 
GEORGE WASHINGTON UNIVERSITY, Washington, DC  
Relevant coursework: Corporate Social Impact, Business Strategy, Sustainability Policy & Ethics, Consultative Processes, 
Global Market Governance and Public Policy 
 
Master of International Management in Marketing 
UNIVERSITY OF MARYLAND, UNIVERSITY COLLEGE, College, Park, MD 
 
Bachelor of Science in Journalism and Political Science 
JAMES MADISON UNIVERSITY, Harrisonburg, VA 
 
Certifications   
 
International Society of Sustainability Professionals 
Certified Sustainability Associate 
 
GRI Certified Training Program Certificate 
Global Reporting Initiative/ISOS Group, Washington, DC 
 
Articles 
 
CrossbowStrategies.com/Blog 
 
Press 
 
CrossbowStrategies.com/Press 
 
Activities 
 
Indoor Cycling Instructor & ACE Certified Personal Trainer, YMCA and Pure Fitness, Salisbury, MD 
 
Member, Shore Velocity Cycling Club, Salisbury, MD 
 
B Local Mid Atlantic, Washington, DC 
 
Green Business Roundtable, Washington, DC  
 
       



RESOLUTION NO. 2981 1 
 2 

 BE IT RESOLVED, by the City of Salisbury, Maryland that the following 3 
individual is appointed to the Sustainability Advisory Committee, for the term ending as 4 
indicated. 5 
 6 
  Name      Term Ending 7 
  Mark Frieden     October 2022 8 
   9 
 10 
 THE ABOVE RESOLUTION was introduced and duly passed at a meeting of the 11 
Council of the City of Salisbury, Maryland held on October 28, 2019. 12 
 13 
ATTEST: 14 
 15 
 16 
_____________________________   _____________________________ 17 
Kimberly R. Nichols     John R. Heath 18 
CITY CLERK      PRESIDENT, City Council 19 
 20 
 21 
APPROVED BY ME THIS 22 
 23 
__________ day of ______, 2019. 24 
 25 
 26 
_____________________________ 27 
Jacob R. Day 28 
MAYOR, City of Salisbury 29 



   

                             MEMORANDUM 
                        
                         
 

To: Mayor Jake Day 

From: Julie English, Administrative Assistant III

Subject: Reappointment to the Parks and Recreation Committee

Date: October 24, 2019 

Mayor Day, the following person has applied for reappointment to the Parks and Recreation 
Committee for the term ending as indicated: 
 
   Name    Term Ending 
   David Plotts   November 2022 
 
Attached you will find information from David Plotts and the resolution necessary for his 
appointment. If you approve of this appointment, I will forward this information to the City 
Council so it may be placed on their agenda at the next Council meeting. Please let me know 
if you have any questions. 
 
Attachment 
 









RESOLUTION NO. 2982 1 
 2 

 BE IT RESOLVED, by the City of Salisbury, Maryland that the following 3 
individual is reappointed to the Parks and Recreation Committee, for the term ending as 4 
indicated. 5 
 6 
  Name      Term Ending 7 
  David Plotts     November 2022 8 
   9 
 10 
 THE ABOVE RESOLUTION was introduced and duly passed at a meeting of the 11 
Council of the City of Salisbury, Maryland held on October 28, 2019. 12 
 13 
ATTEST: 14 
 15 
 16 
_____________________________   _____________________________ 17 
Kimberly R. Nichols     John R. Heath 18 
CITY CLERK      PRESIDENT, City Council 19 
 20 
 21 
APPROVED BY ME THIS 22 
 23 
__________ day of ______, 2019. 24 
 25 
 26 
_____________________________ 27 
Jacob R. Day 28 
MAYOR, City of Salisbury 29 



 

 

 
 
 

COUNCIL AGENDA – Award of Bids 

October 28, 2019 

 

1. Change Order #2       $129,590.70 
 ITB 19-120 Newton Street Community Center 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 

 

 



 

 

 
 
 

To:   Mayor and City Council 
From:  Jennifer Miller 
  Director of Procurement 
Date:  October 28, 2019 
Subject:  Change Order #2 to ITB 19-120 

Newton Street Community Center Remodel 

The Department of Procurement received a request from the Department of Infrastructure & 
Development to process Change Order #2 in the amount of $129,590.70 for Invitation to Bid (ITB) 19-
120 Newton Street Community Center Remodel.  This Change Order provides for revisions to interior 
remodel specifications at the City’s request, and exterior building renovations that are required per the 
Historic District Commission.  Upon Council’s approval of Ordinance 2563 appropriating funds for 
community centers, funding will be available in the Community Center construction project account 
98117-513026-48029. 
 
The Department of Procurement requests Council’s approval to process Change Order #2 as noted 
above to the contractor awarded the original bid, Ocean Tower Construction, LLC.   
 

 

 































































































































































































































ORDINANCE NO. 2566 1 
 2 

 AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY APPROVING AN AMENDMENT 3 
OF THE FY2020 FIRE DEPARTMENT BUDGET TO TRANSFER INSURANCE FUNDS 4 
RECEIVED BY THE CITY TO THE FIRE DEPARTMENT OPERATING BUDGET FROM 5 
THE GENERAL FUND FOR REVENUE RECEIVED FOR REPAIRS TO AMBULANCE A-2. 6 
 7 
 WHEREAS, damage was done to Ambulance A-2, during legitimate City of Salisbury 8 
Fire Department duties; and 9 
 10 

WHEREAS, the Fire Department paid for the repairs to Ambulance A-2 out of the 11 
FY2020 Fire Department Operating Budget; and 12 

 13 
 WHEREAS, the City has received insurance proceeds from the Local Government 14 
Insurance Trust (LGIT) in the amount of $4,827.79 for the repairs to Ambulance A-2; and  15 
 16 
 WHEREAS, the insurance proceeds are to be used to replenish the Fire Department 17 
Operating Budget and to bring it back in line with planned FY2020 budget expense projections 18 
for the remainder of the fiscal year.  19 
 20 
 NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 21 
MARYLAND, that the City’s Fiscal Year 2020 budget be amended as follows: 22 
 23 

1) Increase the General Fund Revenue – Insurance proceeds account by $4,827.79 24 
2) Increase the Fire Department’s Expense - Vehicles account (24035-534308) by 25 

$$4,827.79 26 
 27 
 AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall take effect from and after 28 
the date of its final passage. 29 
 30 

THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 31 
Salisbury held on this ____day of __________ 2019, and thereafter, a statement of the substance 32 
of the Ordinance having been published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on 33 
the ____ day of ______, 2019. 34 
 35 
ATTEST: 36 
 37 
___________________________________  __________________________________ 38 
Kimberly R. Nichols, City Clerk   John R. Heath, President 39 
       Salisbury City Council 40 
 41 
 42 
APPROVED BY ME THIS ____ day of _______, 2019. 43 
 44 
 45 
__________________________________ 46 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 47 



   

                             MEMORANDUM 
                        
                         
To: Julia Glanz, 

From: John W. Tull, Fire Chief 

Subject: Budget Amendment Request 

Date: October 8, 2019 

 
The Fire Department is requesting the approval of a budget amendment in the amount of $5,226.25 
for proceeds received from the auction sale of two (2) Fire Department vehicle’s listed below that 
were declared as surplus: 
 

 1999 Ford Crown Victoria (EMS 1) 
 2005 Chevrolet Suburban (Car 1) 

 
Both vehicles were sold through auction in compliance with City code and policy. 
 
Thank you in advance for your time and consideration on this request.  If you should have any 
questions or need any additional information, please do not hesitate to contact me. 
 
Attachment: Budget Amendment Ordinance 
   
 
 



ORDINANCE NO. 2567 1 
 2 
 AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY APPROVING A BUDGET 3 
AMENDMENT OF THE FY2020 FIRE DEPARTMENT BUDGET TO TRANSFER FUNDS 4 
FROM THE CITY GENERAL FUND TO THE FIRE DEPARTMENT OPERATING BUDGET 5 
TO COVER EXPENSES FOR VEHICLE MAINTENANCE. 6 
   7 
 WHEREAS, the City has declared a 1999 Ford Crown Victoria and a 2005 Chevrolet 8 
Suburban as surplus and the vehicles have been sold at auction: and 9 
 10 
  WHEREAS, both vehicles were operated by the Salisbury Fire Department; and 11 
 12 

WHEREAS, the City has received a total of $5,226.25 from the proceeds generated from 13 
the auction sale and placed the funds in the City General Fund; and  14 

 15 
 WHEREAS, the Fire Department has use for the funds received and requests that the 16 
funds of $5,226.25 be reallocated to the Fire Department Operating Budget for FY2020. 17 
 18 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 19 
MARYLAND that the City’s Fiscal Year 2020 budget be and is hereby amended as follows: 20 
 21 

1) Increase the General Fund Revenue – sale of assets proceeds account by 22 
$5,226.25 23 

2) Increase the Fire Department’s Expense - Vehicles account (24035-534308) by 24 
$5,226.25 25 

 26 
 BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall take effect 27 
from and after the date of its final passage. 28 
 29 
 THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 30 
Salisbury held on the ___ day of __________, 2019, and thereafter, a statement of the substance 31 
of the Ordinance having been published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on 32 
the ___ day of __________, 2019. 33 
 34 
 35 
ATTEST: 36 
 37 
___________________________________  __________________________________ 38 
Kimberly R. Nichols, City Clerk   John R. Heath, President 39 
       Salisbury City Council 40 
 41 
 42 
APPROVED BY ME THIS ____ day of _______, 2019. 43 
 44 
 45 
__________________________________ 46 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 47 



   

                           

                                                                      MEMORANDUM  

 
 

 

To:  City Council 

From:  Kim Nichols, City Clerk 

Subject:  Budget Amendment for possible tie election 

Date:  October 24, 2019 

 

Attached is a budget amendment appropriating funds from the FY 2020 General Fund to 

Elections to conduct a Special Election should the upcoming November 5, 2019 election result 

in a tie in one or more districts. The first reading of the ordinance must occur now in case there 

is a tie so that the second reading and approval by Council can be scheduled within the time 

period needed to conduct the Special Election, within 45 to 60 days after the General Election. 

Our estimates to conduct the Special Election for one district total $12,444.00. If all five districts 

result in ties, approximately $47,370.00 would be required. Because costs of advertising, 

printing and mailings can fluctuate, and we can only estimate the time required from the 

Elections Office staff to conduct this possible additional election, we should transfer $53,000 to 

cover any additional unexpected costs. Attached are the calculated estimates.   

I recommend that the City Council approve the attached ordinance for first reading, and should 

a tie not occur in one or more districts, the budget ordinance will not be presented for second 

reading. If we do need to fund a Special Election, there will be time for a second reading. 

 

 

 

 

 

   

 



Amend

SALARIES

Board Chairman - Annual Compensation

2 Board Members - Annual Compensation

Election Office Staff - County Time ($4500) 900 4500

Election Office Staff - Personal Time ($2000) 400 2000

Part-time Office Help ($11.00 an hour) 200 1000

10 Chief Judges ($350 each) 2 Chiefs 700 10 Chiefs 3500

10 Check In Judges ($250 each) 2 CI 500 10 CI 2500

30 Voting Judges ($250 each) 1 Unit 1500 5 Units 7500

5 Provisional Judges ($225 each)

Mileage - Staff, Election Day Support 250 250

POLLING PLACE RENTALS

Dist 1 thru 5 ($200 each) 1 poll 250 4 polls 1000

(no fee for Fire Dept.)

VOTING EQUIPMENT

E Pollbook Programming 1000 1000

Audio Programming, ADA voting unit 1000 1000

10 DS-200 Scanner Units ($100 each, 2/location) 2 DS-200 200 10 TS 1000

5 ADA Voting Units ($100 each; 1/location) 1 ADA 100 5 ADA 500

12 DS-200 Scanner Unit memory sticks ($50 each) 2 sticks 100 10 sticks 500

10 Electronic Pollbooks ($100 each) 2 EPB 200 10 EPB 1000

2 DS-200 Scanner Units ($100 each, 2/canvass) 2 Unit 600 2 Units 600

Equipment Transportation ($600 per site) - Vendor 1 site 600 5 sites 3000

ADVERTISING

Daily Times Notice of Election 800 800

PRINTING

Sample Ballot production and printing - Vendor 700 3500

7,000 Election Day ballots (40% turnout +$500 fee) 500 2500

700 Absentee Applications - Vendor ($300) 60 300

Envelopes-mailing, Abs return-oath envelope ($200) 40 200

600 Absentee Ballots ($0.20 each) - Vendor 24 120

SUPPLIES - ELECTION AND OFFICE

Polling Place and Election Supplies - $300 60 300

POSTAGE

Specimen Ballot postage- Vendor ($8500) 1700 8500

Postage for mailing Absentee Ballots ($300) 60 300

Total - 1: 12444 Total - 4: 47370

1 Tie Election 5 Tie Elections

(Within 45-60 days)



ORDINANCE NO.2568 1 
 2 
 3 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY APPROVING AN AMENDMENT 4 
OF THE FY 2020 GENERAL FUND BUDGET TO APPROPRIATE FUNDS NEEDED TO 5 
ADMINISTER AN ELECTION IN DISTRICTS ONE, TWO, THREE, FOUR AND FIVE IN THE 6 
EVENT OF A RESULTING TIE IN THE NOVEMBER 5, 2019 CITY ELECTION. 7 

 8 
WHEREAS, the November 5, 2019 City of Salisbury Election may result in a tie for the 9 

winner in one or more election districts; and  10 
  11 
WHEREAS, in that event, the City must fund a Special Election to determine the single 12 

winner of these districts; and 13 
 14 
WHEREAS, the City’s FY 2020 budget does not contain an appropriation sufficient to 15 

cover the expense of conducting this additional election. 16 
 17 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 18 
SALISBURY, MARYLAND THAT THE City’s Fiscal Year 2020 General Fund Budget be and 19 
hereby is amended as follows: 20 
 21 

1) Increase Current Surplus Available (01000- 469810) by $53,000 22 
 23 

2) Increase Elections (13000-xxxxxx) by $53,000 24 
 25 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 26 

Salisbury held on this ____day of __________ 2019, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of 27 
the Ordinance having been published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on the 28 
____ day of ______, 2019. 29 
 30 
 31 
ATTEST: 32 
 33 
___________________________________  __________________________________ 34 
Diane K. Carter, Assistant City Clerk   John R. Heath, President 35 

Salisbury City Council 36 
 37 
 38 
APPROVED BY ME THIS ____ day of _______, 2019. 39 
 40 
 41 
________________________________________ 42 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 43 
 44 

















ORDINANCE  NO. 2569 1 
 2 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND 3 
APPROVING A BUDGET AMENDMENT OF THE GRANT FUND TO 4 
APPROPRIATE FUNDS FROM A COMMUNITY NEEDS GRANT, 5 
FROM THE COMMUNITY FOUNDATION OF THE EASTERN 6 
SHORE, INC., AWARDED FOR THE CITY OF SALISBURY YOUTH 7 
CIVICS COUNCIL. 8 

 9 
WHEREAS, the Community Foundation of the Eastern Shore, Inc. (CFES) has a Community 10 
Needs Grant Fund; and 11 
 12 
WHEREAS, the purpose of the Community Needs Grant is to provide support to a broad 13 
range of charitable programs; and 14 
 15 
WHEREAS, youth empowerment and mobilization is identified as a critical component of the 16 
future of the City of Salisbury; and 17 
 18 
WHEREAS, the mission of the City of Salisbury’s Youth Civics Council is to mobilize and 19 
empower the youth of our community by providing meaningful opportunities to engage in 20 
civic leadership and service; and  21 
 22 
WHEREAS, CFES has awarded a Community Needs Grant to the City of Salisbury, which 23 
provides funding in the amount of $3,512 for the City of Salisbury’s Youth Civics Council; 24 
and 25 
 26 
WHEREAS, appropriations necessary to execute the purpose of this grant must be made upon 27 
the recommendation of the Mayor and the approval of four-fifths of the Council of the City of 28 
Salisbury. 29 
 30 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 31 
SALISBURY, MARYLAND, THAT the City's Grant Fund Budget be amended as follows: 32 
 33 

1) Increase the FY19 CFES Community Needs Grant Revenue Account  34 
(10500-426100-XXXXX) by $3,512 35 
 36 

2) Increase the FY19 CFES Community Needs Grant Expense Account  37 
(10500-546006-XXXXX) by $3,512 38 

 39 
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall take effect from and after the date of 40 
its final passage. 41 
 42 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 43 
Salisbury held on the 28th day of October, 2019, and thereafter, a statement of the substance 44 



of the Ordinance having been published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council 45 
on the 12th day of November, 2019. 46 
 47 
 48 
ATTEST: 49 
 50 
 51 
__________________________________  ______________________________ 52 
Kimberly R. Nichols     John R. Heath 53 
CITY CLERK      COUNCIL PRESIDENT 54 
 55 
 56 
 57 
APPROVED BY ME THIS   58 
_____  day of October, 2019. 59 
 60 
 61 
________________________________ 62 
Jacob R. Day 63 
MAYOR 64 
 65 



ORDINANCE NO. 2562 1 

  AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY TO AMEND SECTIONS 15.04.010, 15.04.020, 2 

AND 15.04.030 OF CHAPTER 15.04 BUILDING CODE BY ADOPTING UPDATED STANDARD CODES 3 

IN SECTION 15.04.010; AMENDING THE AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING 4 

CODE (2018) (IBC) IN SECTION 15.04.020; AND AMENDING THE AMENDMENTS TO THE 5 

INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE (2018) (IPC) IN SECTION 15.04.030, AND TO AMEND SECTION 6 

15.24.040 OF CHAPTER 15.24 HOUSING STANDARDS TO ADOPT THE UPDATED STANDARD 7 

CODES. 8 

  WHEREAS, the ongoing application, administration and enforcement of Title 15, 9 

Buildings and Construction, of the City of Salisbury Municipal Code, demonstrates a need for its 10 

periodic review, evaluation and amendment to keep Title 15 current; and 11 

  WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council may amend Chapter 15.04, Building Code, 12 

pursuant to the authority granted in SC 2‐15 of the Salisbury City Charter and §12‐501, et seq. 13 

of the Public Safety Article, Maryland Annotated Code and related COMAR regulations; and 14 

  WHEREAS, the Mayor and City Council have requested that the Department of 15 

Infrastructure and Development periodically review Title 15 in light of existing building trends 16 

and practices and code updates; and 17 

  WHEREAS, the adoption of the Department of Infrastructure and Development does 18 

recommend approval of the proposed code changes. 19 

  NOW, THEREFORE, be it enacted and ordained by the Council of the City of Salisbury, 20 

Maryland, that Sections 15.04.010, 15.04.020, 15.04.030, and 15.24.040 be amended as 21 

follows: 22 

Chapter 15.04 23 

BUILDING CODE 24 

15.04.010 Adoption of Standards Codes 25 

The City of Salisbury adopts the following Standard Codes: 26 

A.  International Building Code (20152018) (IBC); 27 

B.  International Residential Code (20152018) (IRC); 28 

C.  International Energy Conservation Code (20152018) (IECC); 29 

D.  International Mechanical Code (20152018) (IMC); 30 

E.  International Plumbing Code (20152018) (IPC); 31 

F.  International Fuel Gas Code (20152018) (IFGC); 32 

G.  International Existing Building Code (20152018); and 33 

H. Maryland Accessibility Code.; and 34 

I. International Green Construction Code, (2108) (IGCC). 35 

 36 



15.04.020 Amendments to the International Building Code (20152018) 37 

The following additions and deletions are made to the International Building Code (20152018): 38 

A.  Chapter 1 delete Section 101.2.1 Appendices, and replace with the following: Paragraph 39 

  101.2.1 Appendix provisions on Appendix B. Building Board of Appeals and Appendix I. 40 

  Patio Covers are adopted as part of the IBC. 41 

B.  Chapter 1 delete [A] 101.4.4 Property Maintenance. 42 

C.  Chapter 1 amend [A] 102.6 Existing Structures.  The legal occupancy of any structure 43 

  existing on the date of adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without 44 

  change, except as otherwise specifically provided for in this code, the International  45 

  Existing Building Code, City of Salisbury Property Maintenance Code, International Fire 46 

Code or the NFPA Life Safety Code 101 (2018). 47 

D.  Chapter 1 delete [A] 104.2.1 Determination of substantially improved or substantially 48 

  damaged existing buildings and structures in flood hazard areas. 49 

D.E.Chapter 1 delete [A] 105.2 Work exempt from permit: 2. Fences not over 7 feet 50 

  (2134mm) high and replace with the following:  51 

  [A] 105.2 Work exempt from permit. 52 

  2. Fences less than fifty (50) lineal feet. 53 

E.F. Chapter 1 add [A] 105.2.14 Work exempt from permit:  14. to read as follows:   54 

  “Replacement windows, doors, vinyl/aluminum siding and custom trim.” Exception: 55 

  Windows being replaced in bedrooms shall not be reduced in size or shall comply with 56 

  the minimum requirements of [A] 102.6. 57 

F.G.Chapter 1 amend [A] 109.4 Work commencing before issuance of a permit issuance. 58 

  Any person who commences any work on a building, structure, electrical, gas, 59 

  mechanical or  plumbing system before obtaining the necessary permits may be subject 60 

  to a permit fee two times the amount of the original fee. 61 

 62 

15.04.030 Amendments to the International Plumbing Code (20152018). 63 

The following additions and deletions are made to the International Plumbing Code 64 

(20152018): 65 

A.   Chapter I amend [A] 106.1. Any owner, owner’s authorized agent or contractor who 66 

desires to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of 67 

a building or structure, or erect, install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace 68 

any plumbing system, the installation of which is regulated by this code, or to cause any 69 

such work to be performed, shall first make application to the code official and obtain 70 

the required permit for the work. All work as defined as plumbing in Chapter 2 71 

Definitions, shall be performed by a Maryland registered master or Maryland registered 72 

journeyman plumber. 73 



B. Chapter 1 amend [A] 106.3 Application for permit. Each application for a permit, with the 74 

required fee, shall be filed with the code official on a form furnished for that purpose 75 

and shall contain a general description of the proposed work and its location. The 76 

application shall be signed by the master plumber of record. 77 

C.  Chapter 10 delete Chapter 10 Traps, Interceptors and Separators in its entirety and 78 

replace with the following:  79 

The 2007 2019 Washington Suburban Sanitary Commission Fats., Oils and Grease 80 

Requirements. Section – 1003 Interceptors and Separators with amendments. 81 

 82 

15.24.040 – Referenced standards. 83 

A. Where the following codes are referenced within this Code, they shall be 84 

considered part of the requirements of this Code to the prescribed extent of 85 

each such reference: 86 

1. International Building Code (20152018) (IBC); 87 

2. International Residential Code (20152018) (IRC); 88 

3. International Energy Conservation Code (20152018) (IECC); 89 

4. International Mechanical Code (20152018) (IMC); 90 

5. International Plumbing Code (20152018) (IPC); 91 

6. International Fuel Gas Code (20152018) (IFGC); 92 

7. International Existing Building Code (20152018) (IEBC); 93 

8. Maryland Accessibility Code; and 94 

9. National Electrical Code (2014).; and 95 

10. International Green Construction Code (2018) (IGCC). 96 

 97 

Underlined indicate additions 98 

 Strikethrough indicate deletions 99 

   100 

  AND BE IT FURTHER ENACTED AND ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY of  101 

SALISBURY, MARYLAND, that the Ordinance shall take effect as of January 1, 2020. 102 

  THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 103 

Salisbury held on the ____ day of ___________, 2019, and thereafter a statement of the  104 

substance of the ordinance having been published as requested by law in the meantime,  105 

was finally passed by the Council on the ____ day of ___________, 2019. 106 

   107 

ATTEST: 108 

 109 



_________________________    ______________________________ 110 

Diane K. Carter, Assistant City Clerk    John R. Heath, City Council President 111 

 112 

 113 

Approved by me, this ________day of ______________, 2019. 114 

 115 

__________________________ 116 

Jacob R. Day, Mayor   117 

 118 

 119 

 120 

 121 

 122 

   123 

   124 



ORDINANCE NO. 2563 1 
 2 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY APPROVING AN AMENDMENT OF THE 3 
CITY’S CAPITAL PROJECT FUND BUDGET AND THE FY2020 GENERAL FUND BUDGET TO 4 
APPROPRIATE FUNDS FOR COMMUNITY CENTERS. 5 

 6 
WHEREAS, Ordinance No. 2394 authorized the City to sell bonds in FY17 which appropriated 7 

funds for various capital projects; and 8 
 9 
WHEREAS, the FY17 bond includes funding for Community Centers; and 10 
 11 
WHEREAS, the City has contracted for the construction of the renovations to the Newton Street 12 

Community Center and the costs of the renovations will exceed the allotted budget; and 13 
 14 
WHEREAS, the City desires to purchase the Truitt Street Community Center. 15 
 16 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 17 
MARYLAND THAT THE City’s Capital Projects Fund Budget be and hereby is amended as follows: 18 
 19 
Project Description Account Description  Account Amount 
Revenues:   
Community Center Newton PayGO General Fund  98117-469313-48029 125,000
Community Center Truitt  PayGO General Fund  98117-469313-48029 25,000
Expenditures:   
Community Center Newton Construction 98117-513026-48029 125,000
Community Center Truitt  Land  98117-577010-48029 25,000

 20 
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED, BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY, 21 

MARYLAND, THAT THE City’s Fiscal Year 2020 General Fund Budget be amended as follows: 22 
 23 

1. Increase Current Year Surplus by $150,000.00 24 
2. Increase Transfer General Capital Projects by $150,000.00 25 

 26 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of Salisbury 27 

held on this ____day of __________ 2019, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of the Ordinance 28 
having been published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on the ____ day of ______, 29 
2019. 30 
 31 
 32 
ATTEST: 33 
 34 
 35 
___________________________________  __________________________________ 36 
Diane K. Carter, Assistant City Clerk  John R. Heath, President 37 

 Salisbury City Council 38 
 39 
 40 
APPROVED BY ME THIS ____ day of _______, 2019. 41 
 42 
 43 
________________________________________ 44 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 45 



ORDINANCE NO. 2564 1 
 2 

 AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY APPROVING A BUDGET 3 
AMENDMENT OF THE FY20 GENERAL FUND BUDGET TO ACCEPT AND 4 
APPROPRIATE THE FUNDS RECEIVED FROM THE HERON AGILITY GROUP, FURRY 5 
FRIENDS PET SERVICES, AND MRS. ALLISON NILES IN MEMORY OF HER MOTHER 6 
MRS. JOAN CLARK, FOR THE PURCHASE OF K-9 BULLET PROOF VESTS.    7 
  8 

WHEREAS, Mrs. Denise Jest, of The Heron Agility Group wishes to donate up to 9 
$1,000.00 to the Salisbury Police Department to be used toward the purchase of a police K-9 10 
Bullet Proof Vest; and  11 

 12 
WHEREAS, Mrs. Valarie DeLisle, of The Furry Friends Pet Services wishes to donate up 13 

to $1,000.00 to the Salisbury Police Department to be used toward the purchase of a police K-9 14 
Bullet Proof Vest; and 15 

 16 
WHEREAS, Mrs. Allison Niles, in memory of her mother, Mrs. Joan Clark, wishes to 17 

donate up to $1,000.00 to the Salisbury Police Department to be used toward the purchase of a 18 
police K-9 Bullet Proof Vest; and  19 

 20 
WHEREAS, the funds received from The Heron Agility Group, The Furry Friends Pet 21 

Services, and Mrs. Allison Niles ($3,000.00) will directly benefit the Salisbury Police 22 
Department K-9 Program; and  23 

 24 
WHEREAS, the Salisbury Police Department requests that these funds in the amount of 25 

$3,000.00 be placed in the SPD K-9 Animal Supplies Account, 21021-546010 to purchase Police 26 
K-9 Bullet Proof Vests.     27 

 28 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 29 

OF SALISBURY, MARYLAND that funds of up to $3,000 be accepted from the Heron Agility 30 
Group, The Furry Friends Pet Services, and Mrs. Allison Niles, in memory of her mother, Mrs. Joan 31 
Clark; 32 

 33 
AND BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED BY THE CITY  COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 34 

SALISBURY, MARYLAND that the City’s Fiscal Year 2020 General Fund Budget be and is 35 
hereby amended as follows: 36 

 37 
1) Increase General Fund Revenue by $3,000.00 38 
2) Increase the Police Department budget by $3,000.00.  39 

 40 
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall take effect from and after the 41 

date of its final passage. 42 
 43 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of 44 

Salisbury held on this    day of    , 2019, and thereafter, a statement of 45 
the substance of the Ordinance having been published as required by law, was finally passed by 46 
the Council on the    day of    , 2019. 47 



 48 
ATTEST: 49 
 50 
 51 
             52 
Diane K. Carter, Assistant City Clerk   John R. Heath, President 53 
       Salisbury City Council 54 
 55 
Approved by me this    day of     , 2019 56 
 57 
 58 
      59 
Jacob R. Day., Mayor 60 
 61 
 62 



ORDINANCE NO. 2565 1 
 2 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SALISBURY APPROVING AN AMENDMENT OF 3 
THE FY20 BUDGET TO APPROPRIATE FUNDS FOR STREET RESURFACING AND 4 
CONCRETE REPAIR. 5 
 6 
WHEREAS, the City of Salisbury Department of Infrastructure and Development has completed 7 
paving and concrete repair projects throughout the City that are eligible for reimbursement from 8 
MDOT-SHA; and 9 
 10 
WHEREAS, the City has received a reimbursement from MDOT-SHA in the sum of 11 
$101,178.62; and 12 
 13 
WHEREAS, the Department of Infrastructure and Development seeks to reimburse the operating 14 
account from which the original appropriation was budgeted in order to continue the Citywide 15 
Paving and Concrete Programs. 16 
 17 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 18 
SALISBURY, MARYLAND that the City’s Fiscal Year 2020 budget is hereby amended as 19 
follows: 20 
 21 
1. Increase the MDOT Reimbursement Account by $101,178.62 22 
2. Increase the Citywide Street Maintenance (31000-534318) budget by $101,178.62 23 
 24 
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall take effect from and after the date of its 25 
final passage. 26 
 27 
THIS ORDINANCE was introduced and read at a meeting of the Council of the City of Salisbury 28 
held on the ___ day of _________, 2019, and thereafter, a statement of the substance of the 29 
Ordinance having been published as required by law, was finally passed by the Council on the 30 
___ day of ________, 2019. 31 
 32 
 33 
ATTEST: 34 
 35 
             36 
Diane K. Carter, Assistant City Clerk   John R. Heath, President 37 
       Salisbury City Council 38 
 39 
APPROVED BY ME THIS: 40 
 41 
  day of    , 2019 42 
 43 
      44 
Jacob R. Day, Mayor 45 
 46 


	Agenda

	Res 2980 

	Res 2981

	Res 2982

	Award of Bids
	PUBLIC HEARING - Timber Crest SBY, LLC-Schumaker Lane Annexation - Res 2974 & Res 2975

	Johnson Road-Dirk Widdowson Annexation - Res No 2967 & Res 2968

	Ord 2566 - 1st R

	Ord 2567 - 1st R 

	Ord 2568 - 1st R

	Ord 2569 - 1st R

	Ord 2562 - 2nd R

	Ord 2563 - 2nd R

	Ord 2564 - 2nd R

	Ord 2565 - 2nd R




